
1
Leasing Property With
The WB-37 Exclusive

Listing Contract

2
Form Overview: The
WB-37 – Section By

Section

8
The WRA Property

Management Agreement

9
Form Overview: The
PMA – Section By

Section 

14
The Legal Hotline
Answers Property
Management  And

Rental Issues

15
Conclusion

Inside This Issue

WISCONSIN 
REALTORS®

ASSOCIATION © 2001

While most REALTORS® think of
Wisconsin agency law in terms of
sales transactions, it also has a definite
application in rental and property
management situations. For example,
a licensee must represent his or her
client's interests as an agent, and
there must be an agency agreement
authorizing those brokerage services,
per Wis. Stat. § 452.133. These
requirements apply to property man-
agement and rentals as well as to
sales. Rental agents and property
managers may not provide brokerage
without an agency agreement author-
izing those services. Agency agree-
ments may include a sales listing, a
rental listing, a buyer agency con-
tract, or a property management
agreement. Listings for sales and resi-
dential rentals, as well as the buyer
agency agreement, are all DRL-
approved forms. A property manage-
ment agreement, on the other hand,
may be prepared by a broker, the bro-
ker's attorney, or the landlord per §
RL 16.03(1)(e). 

This Legal Update examines two
agency agreements that may be used
by brokers who have been asked to
rent or lease real estate or provide
property management services: the
WB-37 Exclusive Listing Contract for
Lease of Real Property and the WRA
Property Management Agreement.
Both agreements may be used to
authorize a broker to provide broker-
age services in a rental or property
management setting. In addition, the
agency disclosure form has been
incorporated into the WB-37 and

into the WRA Property Management
Agreement to ensure compliance
with that requirement of real estate
agency law. 

This Update begins with a review of
the newly revised WB-37 Exclusive
Listing Contract for Lease of Real
Property. It then explains when a bro-
ker should choose a WB-37, as
opposed to a property management
agreement or a sales listing, and the
WB-37 is examined section by sec-
tion. Use of a commercial commis-
sion lien with a lease listing is also dis-
cussed, followed by a review of the
WRA Property Management
Agreement on a section-by-section
basis. The Update concludes with a
sampling of Legal Hotline questions
and answers relating to rental and
property management issues. 

WB-37 Exclusive
Listing Contract for
Lease of Real
Property

When helping a client with a rental,
can an agent list the property for sale
and rental? 

Wis. Stat. § 452.135 requires that
before any agent provides brokerage
services to a party, there must be an
agency contract authorizing the
agent to do so. Thus a listing contract
is required before services may be
provided to the owner. The WB-1
Residential Listing Contract provides
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authority to market the property for
sale. The WB-37 Exclusive Listing
Contract Lease of Real Property
should also be used if Caller is
attempting to lease the property for
the owner. 

This section of this Legal Update dis-
cusses the revised WB-37 Exclusive
Listing Contract for Lease of Real
Property, which appears on pages 3 to
5 of this Update. This lease listing
form has an optional use date of
March 1, 2001 and a mandatory use
date of October 1, 2001. 

The WB-37 is not a new form. It has,
however, been updated, reformatted
and given a new title and a slightly dif-
ferent purpose. The form now fills
three letter-sized pages, incorporates
the agency disclosure and other new
provisions and no longer refers to res-
idential real estate in the title of the
form. In fact, as part of the revision
process, the WB-37 has been adapted
to remove or modify any provisions
that would confine use of the WB-37
to residential rental transactions. Thus
the WB-37 may be used in any type of
lease listing scenario including resi-
dential, retail, commercial or industri-
al.

The WB-37 Exclusive Listing
Contract for Lease of Real Property is
used when a property owner hires a
real estate broker to lease the owner’s
property. The form is mandatory with
respect to the lease of residential prop-
erty. Use of the WB-37 is optional,
however, for lease listings in commer-
cial or industrial property settings.
This is noted on the top of the form
immediately following the title line.

Rental Listing versus Property
Management

When a residential property owner
contacts a licensee for assistance with
leasing a property, the first issue to
address is whether the property owner
wants the broker to serve as a rental
agent or as a property manager. If the
owner is looking for a property man-

ager, the licensee should enter into a
property management agreement with
the property owner. Whereas a WB-37
Exclusive Listing Contract for Lease of
Real Property authorizes a broker to
advertise a rental property, get it
leased, and handle the rental funds
(security deposit and rents), the
authorization in a property manage-
ment situation typically is far more
extensive. Property managers general-
ly are expected to handle not only pro-
curement of tenants and execution of
leases, they also are put in charge of
most, if not all, aspects of the day-to-
day operations of the rental property.
This will often include responsibility
for lawn care, snow removal, repairs,
general maintenance, tenancy com-
plaints and terminations, on-site staff,
and bookkeeping for the entire prop-
erty or complex. 

The WB-37 and a property manage-
ment agreement will usually overlap to
the extent that they both authorize
the agent to advertise vacancies, take
tenant applications, qualify and
approve tenants, receive earnest
money and security deposits, execute
leases on behalf of the owner, and col-
lect rents. The property management
agreement, however, will go beyond
this authorization and will empower
the property manager to perform
additional services on behalf of the
owner. A WB-37 is not required for
property managers who lease proper-
ties under the authority of a property
management agreement.

Another common situation where
brokers might question whether a
WB-37 is required when the property
owner is asking the broker who has
the property listed for sale to find a
tenant for the property. When this sit-
uation arises, a WB-37 is required.
Listing a residential property for sale
and lease simultaneously requires both
a WB-1 and a WB-37. This is true
because the WB-1 does not give a
licensee the authority to list the prop-
erty for lease, and the WB-37 does not
give the broker the right to list the
property for sale. Each form contains



specific provisions addressing the
legal requirements for the particular
transaction involved. Any attempt by
a broker to avoid the requirement to
use both forms by altering one form
would not only violate license law but
would very likely jeopardize the legal
rights of the broker in the transac-
tion.

The WB-37,
Section-by- Section

A number of issues must be
addressed when drafting a WB-37.
The way the completed contract
addresses these issues will determine
the relative rights and responsibilities
of the property owner and the bro-
ker.  

Property Description. Lines 1 to 6 of
the WB-37 identify the property to
be rented by the broker by street
address. The parties are encouraged
to add additional description under
Additional Provisions (on page 3 of
the WB-37) or in an addendum. 

Lease Terms. The purpose of chart
on lines 10 to 14 is to provide the
lease terms the broker should be
attempting to negotiate. Blanks are
provided for rent, security deposit,
and other lease terms. Additional
lease terms, included property (such
as appliances or furniture), included
amenities (such as parking or storage
areas), specific marketing instructions
(such as owner repairs or mainte-
nance work credits), and restrictions
on tenants’ use and occupancy may
be placed under Additional
Provisions (on page 3 of the WB-37)
or in an addendum. 

Broker’s Duties
Lines 15 to 20 detail the duties the
broker has agreed to perform for the
property owner. A list of specific
duties is given with a clear directive to
strike any duties which the broker
does not accept. This section also
provides the owner and broker room
to identify any additional duties

which the broker will perform on
behalf of the owner. Additional duties
may include, but are not limited to,
duties typically associated with prop-
erty management, such as mainte-
nance or repairs.

Brokers who are considering which of
the specified duties to accept should
carefully consider the potential liabil-
ity which can result from activities
such as verifying applications, qualify-
ing and approving tenants, executing
leases on behalf of the owner, etc.
Each of these actions carries a signifi-
cant risk of liability under fair hous-
ing and other laws. Accordingly,

REALTORS® may wish to consult
with legal counsel before assuming
any new types of duties.

Owner’s Obligations
Lines 21 to 25 provide a general
statement of the property owner’s
responsibilities to the broker who has
listed the property for lease. Briefly,
these responsibilities require the
owner to cooperate with the broker’s
advertising, showing, and leasing
efforts and provide all necessary
information, documentation and
forms needed for those tasks. The
owner is to provide a lease form for
the broker’s use and allow the broker
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to show the premises at reasonable
times and upon reasonable advance
notice as allowed by law. The list of
owner responsibilities specified in the
WB-37 can be shortened by striking
inapplicable items or can be length-
ened by adding additional responsi-
bilities in the Additional Provisions
area of the form.

With respect to the choice of a lease
form, the DRL no longer has
approved lease forms that must be
used by Wisconsin real estate
licensees. § RL 16.04(2) allows
licensees to use lease forms available
in the marketplace, so long as they

are drafted by an attorney and
approved by the owner. Therefore,
owners of rental properties may
direct the broker to use forms drafted
by attorneys available in the market-
place. The broker may complete the
form as directed by the owner.
Brokers may assist the owner by pro-
viding forms for the consideration of
the owner (or owner’s counsel, if
appropriate). Brokers providing such
forms should assure that any form
provided complies with rules regulat-
ing rental practices and identifies the
drafter. For example, a REALTOR®

entering a WB-37 might recommend
that a property owner use WRA

Residential Lease or Residential
Rental Contract forms.

With respect to showings, owners
(and their properly authorized
agents) have limited rights to enter
the apartment once a tenant moves
into a unit. Wis. Stat. § 704.05(2)
establishes the tenant’s “right to
exclusive possession of the premises.”
This statute requires owners to give
advance notice of entry. Owners may
enter at reasonable times to inspect
the premises, make repairs, or show
the property to prospective tenants or
purchasers. In the City of Madison
and other municipalities, owners
must give notice of entry at least 24
hours in advance. In communities
without applicable ordinances, own-
ers must give notice of entry at least
12 hours in advance per Wis. Adm.
Code § ATCP 134.09(2). Notice
may be verbal or written, but it is
preferable to give written notice to
tenants and keep a copy of all entry
notices for the file.  

Owners may enter a rented apart-
ment only at reasonable times. Early
morning and late evening entry
arguably is not reasonable. Entry
during normal business hours — 8
a.m. to 5 p.m. is usually reasonable.
It may be best to work out an entry
time that both the owners and the
tenant agree is reasonable — advance
notice is not required if the tenant
requests or consents to a proposed
entry at a specified time. No owner
may enter a dwelling without first
announcing his or her presence (by
knocking or ringing the doorbell)
and identifying himself or herself to
anyone present in the dwelling.

Owner’s Warranties and
Representations

Lines 26 to 49 of the WB-37 state
the warranties and representations
made by the owner to the broker.
The initial warranties and representa-
tions relate to any information, mate-
rials or forms the owner provides the
broker.  These warranties are intend-
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ed to shift liability from the broker to
the owner if liability results from the
use of inaccurate information or
improper forms provided by the
owner.

Lines 31 to 33 provide a place to
record any promises the owner may
have made to make repairs. This not
only helps to document promises
made by the owner to the broker, but
it also helps assure compliance with §
ATCP 134.07 which requires that
any landlord promises to tenants to
clean, repair or improve the premises
must be made in writing and must
specify the date or time period when
the work will be completed. The
landlord is also obligated to give ten-
ants written notice of any reasons
beyond the landlord’s control that
are delaying completion. 

Lines 31 to 33 also provide a place to
note any build-outs the owner has
agreed to make. A “build-out” often
refers to a situation where the prem-
ises are being rented before construc-
tion is finished. A build-out refers to
the completion of construction or the
addition of specified improvements
that will be finished before a tenant
takes occupancy. A build-out also
may refer to a situation where a for-
mer tenant left improvements that
need to be removed or where
improvements need to be replaced or
modified to make the premises desir-
able for other tenants. Build-outs are
most common in commercial proper-
ties.

Line 28 confirms that the owner has
not made any rent concessions or
other agreements affecting the prop-
erty. This is important in situations
where the broker and others are rely-
ing on a list of rents or copies of leas-
es to determine total monthly rents
or other material terms of the tenan-
cy. If the owner made a deal with a
tenant after the list of rents or the
lease was drawn up, it is hoped that a
review of these lines will bring out
this information.

Lines 34 to 49 of the WB-37 address
the provisions of § ATCP 134.04(2).
This rule lists code violations and
conditions affecting habitability that
a landlord is legally obligated to dis-
close to a residential tenant before
accepting earnest money or a security
deposit. These lines warrant that the
owner has no notice or knowledge
regarding any of the conditions spec-
ified by the rule.  The broker should
carefully review these lines with the
owner as the broker will be responsi-
ble for disclosing this information to
tenants.

Broker’s Commission
Lines 50 to 51 specify that a broker
working under a WB-37 earns a com-
mission if the owner enters into a
lease or rental agreement for the
premises. A blank line is provided
wherein the parties state the commis-
sion amount. The WB-37 does not
specify how the commission amount
would be calculated or when the
commission must be paid. This was
intentionally left open-ended to allow
brokers and owners to negotiate
whatever form of commission
arrangement they choose. Each bro-
ker, of course, must determine which
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commission policy is appropriate for
that broker, independently of any
other real estate office.

Termination Fee
Lines 52 to 54 allow the owner and
the broker to agree on an amount
which would fairly compensate the
broker for the owner’s premature ter-
mination of the broker’s listing con-
tract due to the owner’s sale,
exchange or other transfer of the
property. The listing contract is ter-
minated if the owner sells or transfers
the listed property. Accordingly,
there is a concern that if the owner
sells the property during the listing,
the broker may be shortchanged on
future commission income, particu-
larly in long-term lease listing con-
tracts. This can be quite unfair to a
broker who has agreed to receive a
commission as a percentage of future
rents or who has spent significant
time and effort to lease a property
only to have the listing period cut
short.

Extension of Listing
The Extension of Listing section on
lines 55 to 67 of the WB-37 is sub-
stantially similar the Extension of
Listing sections found in the DRL-
approved exclusive right-to-sell list-
ing contracts. This is the section that
establishes listing protection, in this
case, with respect to tenants instead
of buyers. As stated in the WB-37,
“The Listing term is extended for a
period of one year as to any tenant
who . . . either negotiated regarding
the lease of the Premises or submitted
a written letter of intent or lease dur-
ing the term of this Listing (protect-
ed tenant).”

Tenants generally may qualify for list-
ing protection in one of four ways
under the WB-37. 

If (1) the tenant submits a written
letter of intent or lease or (2)
negotiates directly with the owner,
listing protection is automatic and
the broker is not required to per-
form any additional steps to initial-
ly protect the tenant for the one-

year override period. On the other
hand, if (3) the tenant attends an
individual showing or (4) negoti-
ates with a broker during the term
of the listing, the tenant is protect-
ed only if the broker delivers the
tenant’s name to the owner within
three days of the expiration of the
lease listing contract. “Negotiate,”
for these purposes, means that the
tenant discussed the potential
terms upon which the tenant may
acquire a leasehold interest in the
property. 

If the tenant is protected under the
listing, the broker then has, in
essence, a one-party listing for the
protected tenants during the one-
year override period. This broker
must present any written letter of
intent, lease or other written propos-
al a protected tenant writes to the
owner, and will earn the listing com-
mission if the proposal is accepted
and closes. This is true even if the
property subsequently has been listed
with another broker. 

The WB-37 lease listing also provides
that if a one-party listing contract
specifically names the tenant(s) to
which it relates, any such tenant qual-
ifying for listing protection is auto-
matically protected by virtue of his or
her name appearing on the contract.

If there is a tenant who, pursuant to
his or her rights under Wisconsin
agency law, indicates that his or her
identity is to remain secret, such a
tenant may be protected by timely
delivering to the owner a notice iden-
tifying the broker with whom the
tenant was working and the date(s) of
any showings or other negotiations.
The WB-37 listing also provides that
the tenant has “submitted an offer”
and thus is automatically protected if
a written letter of intent or lease has
been delivered to the owner or the
listing broker (this will include the
listing agent). 

Attorney’s Fees
Lines 68 to 69 state that in any litiga-

tion arising out of the WB-37 (such
as the broker suing the owner for
earned but unpaid commissions), the
prevailing party is entitled to attor-
ney’s fees. This is a very important
statement because without it attor-
ney’s fees could not be collected.

Fair Housing
Lines 70 to 73 state that each party
to the WB-37 agrees not to partici-
pate in any unlawful act of discrimi-
nation against prospective tenants.
This is an important reminder given
the incidence of fair housing viola-
tions that occur during the advertis-
ing and rental application phases of
the residential rental process.

Agency Disclosures and
Consent to Multiple
Representation

The disclosure of real estate agency
form is incorporated into the WB-37
lease listing in the Agency Disclosure
Provisions section on lines 74 to 135.
The descriptions of the duties owed
to all parties and the duties owed to
clients, the mandatory confidentiality
notice, and the explanation of multi-
ple representation have all been stat-
ed within the body of the WB-37
lease listing. Also included is the con-
sent to multiple representation, the
waiver of confidentiality, and the
blank lines for listing confidential and
non-confidential information.
Accordingly, agents listing a rental
property will not need to have the
owner complete a separate real estate
agency disclosure form. Agency dis-
closure materials found in the WB-37
are substantially the same as those
found in the WRA agency disclosure
forms. 

An agency disclosure form must also
be furnished to prospective tenants
when the broker is actually negotiat-
ing the terms of a lease on behalf of
the owner. The form is not required,
however, if the broker does not nego-
tiate. For example, a licensee does
not negotiate by simply showing the
unit or presenting the tenant with a
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“non-negotiable,” “take-it-or-leave-
it” lease. These activities are basic
administrative tasks, which may be
performed by a non-licensee as well
as a licensee. A real estate license is
not required to complete the lease
form selected by the owner with the
owner’s predetermined rental terms,
and leases are not DRL-approved
forms.

Exclusions
Lines 136-141 provide that tenants
protected under a prior broker’s lease
listing contract are excluded from the
WB-37 lease listing. There also is an
area where the broker may list tenants
whom the owner wishes to except
because of prior contacts or relation-
ships between owner and tenant.
Because courts frown upon putting
the owner in jeopardy of paying two
commissions, the form cautions the
broker and the owner to contact
prior brokers for more information
regarding protected tenants. In
essence, this section works in the
same way as the Exclusions section
on the DRL-approved exclusive right
to sell listing contracts.

Using a Broker
Commission Lien in a
Lease Listing Transaction

A broker commission lien is used in a
commercial lease listing situation to
secure the listing broker’s commis-
sion due under a listing for lease such
as the WB-37 or the WRA’s Exclusive
Listing Contract for Lease of
Commercial Property. Commercial
real estate is defined, for purposes of
the commission lien law, as all real
estate except property that contains
eight or fewer dwelling units, proper-
ty zoned for agricultural purposes,
and undeveloped property zoned for
residential purposes.

Sample Fact Situation: Lease
of Downtown Office Space

Broker D has been talking with
Owner O about entering into a WB-
37 Exclusive Listing Contract for

Lease of Real Property with Owner
O, whereby Broker D would procure
a tenant and negotiate a lease for
downtown office space. It occurs to
Broker D that if she wants to protect
any commissions earned under the
listing for lease with a broker lien, she
must provide Owner O with a Notice
of Intent to Claim Broker Lien
before the date that the listing con-
tract for lease listing is signed.

Notice of Intent to Claim
Broker Lien for Commercial
Lease Listing Broker

The first step in establishing a broker
lien for Broker D is to file or record a
Notice of Intent to Claim Broker
Lien. Broker D will use the Notice of
Intent to Claim Broker Lien form.
This form must be provided to
Owner O at least one day before the
commercial lease listing is signed. 

It will be to Broker D’s benefit to
have the commercial lease listing
negotiated and drafted before Broker
D completes the Notice of Intent to
Claim Broker Lien. When complet-
ing the Notice of Intent to Claim
Broker Lien, Broker D fills in her
company name as the Broker Lien
Claimant, and fills in her company’s
broker licensee number, the name of
the owner (Owner O), and the date
of the WB-37 Exclusive Listing
Contract for Lease of Real Property.
Broker D crosses out the phrases
“listing contract” and “buyer agency
agreement” so that the form reads
“Broker has entered into a written
lease or management agreement with
the Owner or Acquirer of commercial
real estate, as defined in §
779.32(1)(b), Wis. Stats.” 

Broker D also fills in the legal
description and parcel number of the
office building. Broker D dates the
form, prints her individual name on
the form, and signs her individual
name before a notary.

Once the form is notarized, Broker D
makes a copy of the completed form

for her files, and delivers the original
to Owner O on January 6.

Terms of Commercial Lease
Listing 

On January 7, Broker D enters into a
WB-37 Exclusive Listing Contract
for Lease of Real Property with
Owner O. Owner O would like a
minimum lease term of 36 months
for the 1,500-square feet of rentable
area. The listing broker’s commission
is 7 percent of the base rent, with 3.5
percent due upon the lease signing,
3.5 percent due upon the tenant’s
occupancy, and 7 percent due on the
anniversary date of the lease signing
throughout the balance of the lease
term. A 3.5 percent commission is
also due upon any lease renewal.

Notice of Broker Lien in
Commercial Lease Listing
Transactions

The Notice of Broker Lien in the case
of a commercial lease listing must be
filed with the register of deeds and
mailed to the owner no later than 90
days after the broker earns a commis-
sion, or the broker receives notice
that he or she has earned a commis-
sion, whichever is later. A fee is con-
sidered to be earned on the date that
payment of the fee is due under the
broker’s agreement. The broker thus
need not file any broker liens until
such time that the owner fails to pay
a commission that is due and is in
default for 89 days. 

The broker may use the threat of fil-
ing a broker lien to encourage the
owner to make timely commission
payments. If the owner is 90 days in
default, the broker can file a broker
lien and satisfy it once the commis-
sion payment has been received. If
the owner is again 90 days in default
with a later payment, the broker can
file another broker lien. This hopeful-
ly would not be necessary because
after the broker has filed one broker
lien, the owner is apt to make serious
efforts to avoid repeating the broker
lien process.
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Waiver of Broker Lien Rights
Meanwhile, Owner O has faxed a
copy of the Notice of Intent to Claim
Broker Lien to her attorney and is
asking whether she can avoid having
any broker liens filed against the
office building. The attorney suggests
that other than making sure that
Broker D is paid on time, that maybe
Broker D would sign a lien waiver if
Owner O can find some other way to
secure the payment of her commis-
sion payments. Owner O is adamant
that Broker D signs a lien waiver, so
Broker D agrees to waive the broker
lien if Owner O posts a letter of cred-
it as security for the commission pay-
ments.

Broker D prepares a Waiver of Broker
Lien Rights, using the WRA form.
Broker D fills in Owner O’s name on
the top line and the legal description
of the office building. Broker D
checks the item labeled
“Leasing/Management Broker,” and
fills in the cut off date — Owner O
wants the waiver to cover any com-
missions due during the first three
years of any lease procured during the
term of the lease listing. Broker D
fills in the date of the Notice of
Intent to Claim Broker Lien (January
6), but leaves the filing date and doc-
ument number blank because the
notice of intent in leasing and prop-
erty management situations is not
filed or recorded with the register of
deeds. Broker D executes the waiver
before a notary and provides the
original to Owner O on January 28.

Terms of Retail Lease
After prolonged negotiations, Owner
O enters into a four-year commercial
lease with Lessee W on April 19 who
takes occupancy on June 1. Broker D
earns a 3.5 percent commission upon
the April 19 lease signing, a 3.5 per-
cent commission upon the June 1
occupancy, and a 7 percent commis-
sion on the anniversary of the lease
signing for the next three years. 

Payment of Broker D’s commission is

secured by the letter of credit posted
by Owner O. Although no broker
lien is ever filed, the possibility of one
has given Broker D the bargaining
power to obtain reliable security for
the commission payments that are
due to her. Although it is not likely
that many owners will insist upon lien
waivers or post other security, this
example illustrates the potential
leverage generated by the filing of a
Notice of Intent to Claim Broker
Lien.

For additional information about the
commercial commission lien law and

forms, see Legal Updates 98.06 and
98.09. Legal Update 98.09 is found
online at www.wra.org. Broker lien
forms are available on WRA Zip
Forms.

WRA Property
Management Agreement

Can a non-licensee manage an apart-
ment for someone?

Yes. A property manager does not
need to be licensed as a broker,
although many are. Rental agents
who merely show residential rental
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property, accept applications and pro-
vide information to prospective ten-
ants are not regarded within the defi-
nition of “broker.” However, actual
negotiations of lease terms or entry
into a lease by the rental agent are
acts of real estate brokerage, and
therefore, require licensure.
Unlicensed rental agents or managers
must not be paid on a percentage of
rentals, but rather on a salary basis.
They must restrict their activities to
showing units, giving basic informa-
tion, taking rental applications and
accepting/receipting rental deposits
in the form of checks (but not cash).

Real estate licensees are allowed to
draft property management agree-
ments for their own use under § RL
16.03(1)(e). Property management
agreements can also be obtained in
the marketplace. The Wisconsin
REALTORS® Association has devel-
oped a property management agree-
ment which may be used if the parties
or their attorneys do not draft their
own agreement. The WRA Property
Management Agreement is designed
for use by real estate licensees, but
may be modified for use by anyone.
The WRA Property Management
Agreement appears on pages 8 - 10 of
this Update, and is discussed in the
following section of this Update.

The WRA Property Management
Agreement is a new form. It is not a
DRL-approved form so its use is
completely optional. Like the revised
WB-37 Exclusive Listing Contract
Lease of Real Property, this form fills
three letter-sized pages and incorpo-
rates agency disclosure provisions. 

WRA Property Management
Agreement, Section-by-
Section

A number of property management
issues are raised in the WRA Property
Management Agreement.  The way
the completed contract addresses
these issues will determine the rela-
tive rights and responsibilities of the
property owner and the property

manager. Because each rental proper-
ty and rental owner is unique, the
best approach is to have a customized
property management agreement
prepared for each situation. When
that is not possible, the WRA
Property Management Agreement
(PMA) may be used. 

Parties & Property Description
Lines 1 to 7 of the PMA identify the
parties and the property to be exclu-
sively managed, using the street
address. The parties are encouraged
to add any additional description
under Additional Provisions (on page
3 of the PMA) or in an addendum. 

Collection of Rent and Other
Income

Lines 8 to 11 ask the parties to spec-
ify whether the owner or the manag-
er shall collect all security deposits,
rent, income and other money rela-
tive to the operation of the rental
property. If this will be the manager’s
responsibility, the parties must also
indicate whether the manager should
handle the funds using the owner’s
account or the manager’s trust
account.

From the perspective of a manager
who is a licensed real estate broker,
funds from rental and property man-
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agement activities generally may be
deposited in one of three types of
accounts: (1) a traditional non-inter-
est bearing trust account, (2) an
interest-bearing trust account for
non-client funds, or (3) the rental
owner’s account. Rental application
deposits, security deposits and rent
may be deposited into one of these
accounts whether the owner is a
third-party owner or a real estate
licensee. A broker who holds proper-
ty management funds in a trust
account must disburse any earned
property management fees on a regu-
lar monthly basis unless otherwise
agreed in a written property manage-
ment agreement.

Traditional non-interest bearing trust
account. Non-client funds such as
security deposits and rent may be
deposited in a regular trust account –
the one with which licensees are his-
torically familiar.

Interest-bearing trust account for
non-client funds. Rental transaction
funds may also be deposited in an
interest-bearing trust account provid-
ed the broker obtains written author-
ization of the parties for whom the
funds are being held. The authoriza-
tion must specify how and to whom
the interest will be paid. Typically
interest from these accounts is
payable to one or both parties — no

interest may be paid to or applied to
the benefit of the broker. This type of
interest-bearing account may be
needed by brokers in communities
that require that interest be paid to
tenants on their security deposits.

Rental owner’s account. Funds from
property management and leasing
activities may also be deposited into
the rental owner’s account. An
“owner’s account” is an account
maintained by the rental property
owner for the deposit and disburse-
ment of the owner’s funds. A broker
may deposit rental application
deposits, security deposits and rent
into the owner’s account provided
these checks are payable to one or
more of the owners or to the owner’s
account (e.g., “Sunset Apartments”).
The application form, lease, and
other tenant paperwork should direct
the tenant to make his payments
payable to the owner. If payments are
mistakenly made payable to the
licensee, the funds must go into the
broker’s trust account. The owner
may designate the broker as a signa-
tory on the owner’s account and
authorize the broker to make dis-
bursements from the account. Such
authorization should be in writing,
often in the lease listing or property
management agreement 

The rules, however, do not authorize
brokers to place rental transaction
funds in an interest-bearing common
trust account (IBRETA). Such
deposits may put banks in technical
violation of federal banking law. The
rules, on the other hand, do not for-
bid the deposit of rental transaction
funds into interest-bearing common
trust accounts (IBRETA). Since it is
not entirely clear what the effects of
such a practice might be, it is best to
avoid this practice.

Disbursement of Property
Funds

Lines 12 to 22 of the PMA contain
the manager’s authorization from the
owner to disburse funds from the
property account. Specifically, the
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manager is directed to pay him or
herself when due (the fifth day of the
month), and to reimburse any
expenses he or she has paid from his
or her own personal account on
behalf of the owner within 30 days.
The manager is also directed to pay
all necessary and properly incurred
operational or property management
expenses paid on behalf of the owner.
These expenses may include insur-
ance premiums, real estate taxes,
mortgage payments, supplies, adver-
tising costs, and maintenance costs.
The manager must also disburse
funds to the owner upon the owner’s
request, provided  there are sufficient
funds in the property account. The
manager is to maintain adequate
reserves and working capital in the
property account and to notify the
owner if additional dollars are needed
to pay monthly expenses.

Manager's Compensation
The manager's compensation poten-
tially includes several different com-
ponents, as indicated on lines 23 to
28 of the PMA. 

The manager may receive:
•A management fee equal to a per-
centage of the gross rents, a leasing
and/or renewal fee equal to a per-
centage of one month's rent payable
whenever the manager procures a
new lease or a lease renewal;
•A termination fee equal to a per-
centage of the property sales price if
the owner sells the rental property
and thereby terminates the property
management agreement; 
•A bad debt collection fee equal to a
percentage of the bad debts collected
by the manager; 
•An insurance claim settlement fee
equal to a percentage of any gross
settlement amount; 
•And, any other compensation writ-
ten by the parties on the blank line
provided line 28 of the PMA. 

The owner and manager shall negoti-
ate what the appropriate percentage
rates should be for each of these
items.

§ RL 18.09(3)(b) requires a broker
providing property management
services to disburse the fee earned for
his or her services on a monthly basis
unless otherwise agreed in a written
property management agreement
signed by the parties. Line 23 of the
PMA specifies that the manger shall
pay his or her compensation monthly
no later than the fifth day of the
month.

Manager’s Authority
Lines 29 to 60 detail aspects of the
manager’s authority to operate the
rental property including advertising,
leases, legal action, maintenance and
repairs, utilities and service contracts,
and employees. The manager agrees
to use his or her professional knowl-
edge and skills and reasonable efforts
in performing these duties under the
agreement. The manager also agrees
to pay all expenses related to the
property and authorized under the
PMA.

Advertising. The manager should use
reasonable means to advertise avail-
able rental units, including the
Internet, to show the rental units and
to display “for sale” and other appro-
priate signs. Advertising expenses in
excess of a designated level require
the owner’s prior consent.

Showings. With respect to showings,
owners (and their properly author-
ized agents and mangers) have limit-
ed rights to enter the apartment once
a tenant moves into a unit. Wis. Stat.
§ 704.05(2) establishes the tenant’s
“right to exclusive possession of the
premises.” This statute requires own-
ers to give advance notice of entry.
Owners may then enter at reasonable
times to inspect the premises, make
repairs, or show the property to
prospective tenants or purchasers. In
the City of Madison and other
municipalities, owners must give
entry notice at least 24 hours in
advance. In communities without
applicable ordinances, owners must
give entry notice at least 12 hours in
advance per Wis. Adm. Code § ATCP

134.09(2). Notice may be verbal or
written, but it is preferable to give
written notice to tenants and keep a
copy of all entry notices.  

Owners may enter a rented apart-
ment only at reasonable times. Early
morning and late evening entry
arguably is not reasonable. Entry
during normal business hours – 8
a.m. to 5 p.m. – is usually reasonable.
It may be best to work out an entry
time that both the landlord and the
tenant agree is reasonable — advance
notice is not required if the tenant
requests or consents to a proposed
entry at a specified time. No landlord
may enter a dwelling without first
announcing his or her presence (by
knocking or ringing the doorbell)
and identifying him or herself to any-
one present in the dwelling.

Leases. The DRL no longer has
approved forms for leases that must
be used by Wisconsin real estate
licensees. § RL 16.04(2) provides
that licensees can use lease forms
drafted by the owner or by an attor-
ney. Therefore, lines 36 to 38 direct
the manager to use the lease forms
provided by or approved by the
owner (must be drafted by the owner
or attorneys). The manager may assist
the owner by providing forms for the
consideration of the owner (or
owner’s counsel, if appropriate). The
manager is authorized to negotiate,
sign, terminate and renew leases on
behalf of the owner. No lease term
may exceed one year without the
owner’s prior approval.

Legal Action. The manager is author-
ized to sign and serve notices on
behalf of the owner. Lines 39 to 43
authorize the manager, to the extent
allowed by law, to sue on behalf of
the owner to terminate tenancies,
evict tenants, recover possession of
the rental property, to recover rents
and other money due to the owner,
and settle and compromise any of
these legal claims. The manager is
authorized to hire an attorney to
assist in these endeavors.
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The manager’s ability to function as a
legal representative of the owner may
be limited because of Wis. Stat. §
757.30, which provides in part:

“Penalty for practicing without
license.  (1) Every person, who with-
out having first obtained a license to
practice law as an attorney of a court
of record in this state, as provided by
law, practices law within the meaning
of sub. (2), or purports to be licensed
to practice law as an attorney within
the meaning of sub. (3), shall be
fined not less than $50 nor more than
$500 or imprisoned not more than
one year in the county jail or both,
and in addition may be punished as
for a contempt. (2) Every person who
appears as agent, representative or
attorney, for or on behalf of any other
person, or any firm, co partnership,
association or corporation in any
action or proceeding in or before any
court of record, court commissioner,
or judicial tribunal of the United
States, or of any state, or who other-
wise, in or out of court, for compen-
sation or pecuniary reward gives pro-
fessional legal advice not incidental to
his or her usual or ordinary business,
or renders any legal service for any
other person, or any firm, partner-
ship, association or corporation, shall
be deemed to be practicing law with-
in the meaning of this section.”

Therefore, unless the licensee was
part owner of the rental property or
the licensee held a license to practice
law in Wisconsin, representing a
property owner in a court action
would constitute the unlicensed prac-
tice of law.

In addition, Wis. Stat. § 799.06(2)
provides with respect to small claims
court appearances: “A person may
commence and prosecute or defend
an action or proceeding under this
chapter and may appear in his, her or
its own proper person or by an attor-
ney regularly authorized to practice
in the courts of this state. Under this
subsection, a person is considered to
be acting in his, her or its own prop-

er person if the appearance is by a
full-time authorized employee of the
person. An assignee of any cause of
action under this chapter shall not
appear by a full-time authorized
employee, unless the employee is an
attorney regularly authorized to prac-
tice in the courts of this state.”

Maintenance and Repairs. Lines 44
to 50 put the manager in charge of
maintaining the property in a good
state of repair and appearance. To this
end, the manager is authorized to
purchase or lease all necessary equip-
ment, tools, appliances, materials,
and supplies; and to hire outside con-
tractors. The manager must have the
owner’s prior approval for any one
expenditure that exceeds a specified
amount unless it is for emergency
repairs or maintenance (necessary to
protect the property from damage or
to maintain services for tenants per
the leases).

Utilities and Repairs. The manager is
authorized by lines 51 to 54 to enter
into contracts for electricity, gas, fuel,
water, telephone service, cleaning,
trash removal, snow removal, lawn
care, pest control, and any other serv-
ices or commodities necessary for the
efficient operation and maintenance
of the property. Owner approval is
required for any contract with a term
in excess of three years and the owner
agrees to assume all contracts upon
termination of the property manage-
ment agreement.

Employees. Lines 55 to 60 authorize
the manager to hire, fire and super-
vise all on-site managers, mainte-
nance staff and other employees. The
parties designate on line 57 whether
all on-site managers, maintenance
staff and other employees shall be the
employees of the owner or the man-
ager. The designated employer shall
be responsible for all damages and
injuries caused by the employees’
actions or omissions unless caused by
the other party’s negligence or inten-
tional wrongdoing. The employer
must maintain workers compensation

coverage for the employees, but the
owner shall be responsible for all
employment expenses and must
approve all hires in advance. In other
words, the owner bears the financial
costs of the employees while the party
who bears the potential legal liability
is negotiable between the owner and
manager. 

Books of Account and Records
Lines 61 to 70 indicate that the man-
ager maintain all books and records
for the operation of the rental prop-
erty, subject to monitoring by the
owner. To that end, the owner shall
be provided with a detailed monthly
income and expense statement, an
annual income and expense report. If
instructed by the owner, the manager
shall retain the accountant selected by
the owner. The accountant shall pro-
vide the owner with a balance sheet
and a profit and loss statement at the
conclusion of the accounting year, at
the owner’s expense.

Owner Cooperation
Lines 71 to 73 contain a general
statement of the property owner’s
responsibilities to the manager. The
owner must cooperate with the man-
ager by providing all data, records,
documents, rules, regulations and
other materials required to manage
the property, a lease form for the
manager’s use, and the names of
prospective tenants.

Regarding choice of a lease form, the
DRL no longer has approved lease
forms that must be used by
Wisconsin real estate licensees. § RL
16.04(2) provides that licensees can
use lease forms available in the mar-
ketplace, so long as they are drafted
by an attorney and approved by the
owner. A licensed broker/manager
may complete the form as directed by
the owner. Brokers may assist the
owner by providing forms for the
consideration of the owner (or
owner’s counsel, if appropriate).
Brokers providing such forms should
assure that any form provided com-
plies with rules regulating rental prac-
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tices and identifies the drafter. For
example, a REALTOR® entering a
PMA might recommend that the
owner use the WRA Residential
Lease or Residential Rental Contract
form.

Insurance
Lines 74 to 77 require the owner to
carry a minimum liability coverage of
$2 million and to name the manager
and all on-site managers, employ-
ment staff, and other employees as
additional insureds. The owner must
maintain comprehensive coverage on
the rental property in the amount the
owner deems appropriate.

Indemnification
In lines 78 to 79 the owner agrees to
indemnify and hold the manager
harmless for losses, damages, costs
and expenses, including attorneys’
fees arising out of the PMA. This
does not apply if the loss, damage,
cost or expense arises from the man-
ager’s gross negligence or intentional
wrongdoing. This provision should
provide a fair amount of comfort and
security for the manager because the
owner is standing behind the manag-
er in a wide range of circumstances,
including ordinary negligence. The
manager is well advised to obtain his
or her own liability insurance.

Default
If either the owner or the manager
commits a material default of the
PMA and the default is not cured
within 10 days after delivery of a
notice of default from the other
party, the agreement is terminated, as
described in lines 80 to 83. Thus if
one party believes the other is in
material default of the PMA, that
party must give the defaulting party
written notice stating the default, and
may terminate the PMA only if the
default is not cured within 10 days of
delivery of the notice.

The provision awarding attorneys’
fees to the prevailing party in the
event of litigation regarding a default
of the PMA may encourage resolu-

tion through informal means such as
arbitration or mediation before
resorting to the courts.

Delivery
The delivery provisions on lines 84 to
87 are similar to those seen on most
real estate forms. Delivery of a writ-
ten notice or other document to the
other party may be by personal deliv-
ery, mail or delivery service, or fax.

Miscellaneous Provisions
Lines 88 to 99 contain an assortment
of boiler plate contract provisions:
(1) the agreement is governed by
Wisconsin law, (2) the entire agree-
ment of the parties is reflected in the
PMA, (3) any amendments must be
in writing and signed by both parties,
(4) no waiver of any default or breach
shall be construed as a waiver of any
subsequent default (if one party lets a
default go once, it does not mean
that he or she cannot give a notice of
default if it happens again), and (5) if
one provision in the PMA is found to
be unenforceable it shall not affect
the enforceability or validity of any
other PMA provisions. Lines 88 to
99 also provide that the PMA may be
executed in counterparts, that faxed
documents shall be treated as original
documents, and that faxed signatures
shall be treated as original signatures.
The PMA is binding upon the par-
ties, and their personal representa-
tives, successors and assigns.

Agency Disclosures and
Consent to Multiple
Representation

The disclosure of real estate agency
form is incorporated into the PMA in
the Agency Disclosure Provisions sec-
tion on lines 100 to 149. The
descriptions of the duties owed to all
parties and the duties owed to clients,
the mandatory confidentiality notice,
and the explanation of multiple rep-
resentation have all been stated with-
in the body of the PMA. Also includ-
ed are blank lines for listing confiden-
tial and non-confidential informa-
tion. Accordingly, agents entering a

property management agreement will
not need to have the owner complete
a separate real estate agency disclo-
sure form. Agency disclosure materi-
als found in the PMA are substantial-
ly the same as those found in the
WRA agency disclosure forms. There
are no lines for a consent to multiple
representation or a waiver of confi-
dentiality. These will typically not be
considerations between a rental prop-
erty owner and a property manager.

An agency disclosure form must also
be furnished to prospective tenants
when the broker is actually negotiat-
ing the terms of a lease on behalf of
the owner. The form is not required,
however, if the broker is not negoti-
ating the lease terms. For example,
when a licensee is simply showing the
unit or presenting the tenant with a
“non-negotiable,” “take-it-or-leave-
it” lease, no negotiation is involved.
These activities are basic administra-
tive tasks, which may be performed
by a non-licensee as well as a licensee.
A real estate license is not required to
complete the lease form selected by
the owner with the owner’s predeter-
mined rental terms, and leases are not
DRL-approved forms.

Lead-Based Paint Provisions
In lines 150-155 the parties designate
who will deal with lead-based paint
(LBP) issues relating to the rental
property. This includes the identifica-
tion and elimination of LBP hazards
and compliance with all federal and
state LBP laws. As REALTORS®

know, this is a serious responsibility
that should not be taken lightly. The
potential liability involved can be
enormous if a child is poisoned by an
LBP hazard on the property or if the
owner is cited for violation of the fed-
eral LBP disclosure or other laws.
REALTORS® looking for on the lat-
est LBP information may go to
http://www.wra.org/Resources/LB
Presources.htm, on the WRA Web
site, for a comprehensive grouping of
LBP resources and information.
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Term
Lines 169 to 174 give the parties a
choice as far as stating the term of the
PMA. The parties can agree to an
indefinite term that will come to an
end only upon delivery of a 60-day
notice of termination, or the parties
can select a one-year term that is
automatically renewed for additional
one-year terms. Automatic renewal
ends when a written termination
notice is delivered by one party at
least 30 days before the original or a
renewal expiration date. The second
choice will cause the parties to recon-
sider their relationship each year. It
will provide more certainty and sta-
bility because the parties will know
that if there is no termination notice
at renewal time, the agreement will
continue on for at least another year.
The first choice is more flexible
because the agreement may be termi-
nated at any time upon 60 days writ-
ten notice.

Legal Hotline Questions
And Answers

The WRA Legal Hotline receives a
variety of questions relating to prop-
erty management relationships and
rental issues. The following is a small
sample of the issues raised by Hotline
callers.

When does an agent for a landlord
need a real estate license?

Rental agents who merely show resi-
dential rental property, accept appli-
cations and provide information to
prospective tenants are not regarded
as within the definition of “broker.”
However, actual negotiations of lease
terms or entry into a lease by the
rental agent are acts of real estate
brokerage and, therefore, require
licensure.

Unlicensed rental agents or managers
must not be paid on a percentage of
rentals (but rather on a salary basis);
and must restrict activities to showing
units, giving basic information, tak-
ing rental applications, and accept-

ing/receipting rental deposits in the
form of checks (but not cash).

What are the rules that apply to return
of security deposits?

Security deposits, their return and
charges against them are the most
frequent area of dispute in
landlord-tenant relations. The return
of security deposits is regulated by
Wis. Admin. Code § ATCP 134.06.
This rule defines “surrender” of the
premises and limits the basis upon
which a landlord may withhold secu-
rity deposits. Security deposits may
be withheld for tenant damage, waste
or neglect, nonpayment of rent or
utility charges, or other lawful rea-
sons designated in NONSTAN-
DARD RENTAL PROVISIONS.
The rule also establishes the timing
and manner of giving notice when all
or part of a security deposit is with-
held. A detailed statement of claims
must be given with a return of any
security deposit balance owed within
21 days after the tenant surrenders
the premises. Failure to comply with
the rule is a violation of Wis. Stats. §
100.20(5), which allows recovery of
double damages, costs, and attorney
fees. This rule and its damages provi-
sion have been tested in the courts
and upheld.  See Pierce v. Norwick,
202 Wis. 2d 588 (1996).

Must an agent for a landlord or rental
owner make agency disclosures to a ten-
ant? When must the agency disclosure
form be given to a prospective tenant?

Standard of Practice 16-12 provides
that “REALTORS®, acting as agents
or brokers of sellers/landlords or as
subagents of listing brokers, shall dis-
close that relationship to buyers/ten-
ants as soon as practicable and shall
provide written confirmation of such
disclosure to buyers/tenants not later
than execution of any purchase or
lease agreement. (Amended 1/98)”
The most conservative view may be
that the agency disclosure form is
triggered if the tenant wishes to make
any changes in the lease – when the

agent begins to deliver negotiation
messages back and forth between
landlord and tenant. 

§ RL 24.07(8)(e) provides with
respect to listings for lease and prop-
erty management contracts that
“Licensees entering into listings for
lease or property management con-
tracts with property owners shall pro-
vide to their clients the disclosure
form required under s. 452.135,
Stats. A licensee shall also provide an
agency disclosure form to prospective
tenants when the licensee is actually
negotiating the terms of a lease on
behalf of the owner. A licensee is not
required to provide an agency disclo-
sure form to a prospective tenant in
situations when the licensee does not
negotiate the terms of a lease, such as
when the rental unit is only being
shown to the prospective tenant or a
completed and “non-negotiable”
lease is presented to a prospective
tenant.”

The tenant paid rent through July, but
moved out early before the end of July.
He turned in the keys and surrendered
the apartment, which is ready for
inspection. If the landlord lets a new
tenant move in early before the end of
July, is the landlord obligated to pay
the former tenant any compensation
for letting the new tenant move in
early?

If there has been a mutually agreed
upon early lease termination
(expressed in a written agreement
which sets the new lease termination
date and prorates rent and any other
applicable charges), new tenants may
move in early. Since the former ten-
ant in this case paid rent through
July, however, he should be compen-
sated for the days in July the new ten-
ant occupies the unit. If there has not
been an early termination, no new
tenants should be permitted to occu-
py the premises without the former
tenant’s permission. It has to be one
way or the other: either the apart-
ment is rented through the end of
July or there is an early termination.
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What are the laws regarding evictions
between October through February?

Wisconsin law does not make any distinc-
tions in its eviction laws based on the time
of the year. A landlord may wish to see if
any local ordinance restricts winter evic-
tions.

May a property manager or some other
agent fill out the landlord’s LBP disclosures
and otherwise take those steps necessary to
comply with the LBP disclosure law?

A landlord may authorize an agent, such as
a property manager, to fulfill the land-
lord’s disclosure responsibilities under the
federal LBP law. This includes providing
any information known to the landlord or
agent about LBP on the premises, and the
completion of the LBP disclosure form.
Such action by an authorized agent binds
the landlord, who is ultimately responsible
for full compliance with the disclosure law
and for any failure of the agent to provide
all required information. Thus, a property
manager can complete a LBP disclosure
form such as Addendum L for the owner,
provided that the property manager is
properly authorized. For the property
manager’s protection, such authority is
best given in writing such as in the prop-
erty management agreement. See Legal
Update 96.07 for discussion of the steps
that must be taken by a rental agent or
property manager to comply with the fed-
eral LBP rules.

A broker/salesperson is thinking of starting
a property management company. Can he
operate a separate property management
company and still sell real estate for his bro-
ker/employer? Can this property manage-
ment company be a partnership with the
broker/salesperson and a non-licensee as the
partners? 

The broker/salesperson can operate a
property management business as an inde-
pendent practice pursuant to § RL
17.03(1). To practice independently
under this rule, the broker/salesperson
must have the written consent of the
employing broker and must avoid conflicts
of interest. All  other normal aspects of a
brokerage, such as establishing a trust

account and observing disclosure duties
must be present. The broker/employer
should have no responsibility for the inde-
pendent practice if the broker/salesperson
establishes his or her individual operations
as clearly independent, similar to the way
in which salespeople engaging in personal
real estate transactions distance these
transactions from the company's business.  

According to the Department of
Regulation and Licensing, this independ-
ent practice could be conducted as a
licensed partnership with the
broker/salesperson as the sole licensed
broker/partner. The partnership would be
licensed as provided in Wis. Stat. §
452.12(2). The other partners and
employees could not be licensees in order
to maintain compliance with the inde-
pendent practice rules.

Conclusion
A REALTOR® asked to rent out a proper-
ty for a client must first determine whether
the client wants simply basic rental servic-
es or whether they want complete proper-
ty management services. If the client wants
simple rental services, the license will use
the WB-37 Exclusive Listing Contract for
Lease of Real Property. If the client wants
a property manager, the licensee may use
the WRA Property Management
Agreement if a customized, attorney-
drafted property management agreement
is not available. Both agreements provide
helpful guidance to licensees providing
brokerage services to rental property own-
ers.
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